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or withdrawal/rejection due to multiple submissions).

I will be your editor and I will stay at your disposition for all the aspects
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Dear Dr. Dewi Elfidasari,

We would like to inform you that after the preliminary evaluation your paper is
qualified for processing (reviewing).

Before proceeding to the review please consider that a processing publication
fee of 250 USD is required. The average duration of the publication process is
10 weeks, but it can be reduced in exchange of a priority tax of 50 USD
(http://www.bioflux.com.ro/journal/).
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reimbursed (exceptions are made in the cases of poor feedback from authors
or withdrawal/rejection due to multiple submissions).
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Concerning the payment procedure, you will find all the details bellow and | would like to kindly ask you to
send me the scanned receipt of the payment in order to start the publishing process. Upon reception of your
payment receipt we will send you the invoice.

1st payment option:

Beneficiary:

Bioflux SRL

City: Cluj-Napoca ,

Country: Romania, European Union;

SWIFT CODE of the bank: BTRLRO22

Account USD:
RO68BTRL01302202L28614XX

Bank:
BANCA TRANSILVANIA

Important! When bank transfer is used to pay a publication fee, please choose
the right option, which is "US”! (among the three options you have: Ben, Our,
Us).

The option “Us” means that all the transfer fees are at your charge. Please note that in case you do not
specify the “Us” option, the payment will not be valid.

2nd payment option:
via Paypal. If you can process such a payment we can start the online form.

If you prefer this option please let us know and we will send you the invoice via Paypal and afterwards you
can process the payment.


http://www.bioflux.com.ro/journal/

For this payment option you need a credit card (international, non-iranian card). Please take into account
that all bank taxes are in your concern.

Do not hesitate to contact me for any kind of questions related to the process.

Thank you for publishing with us!

Kind regards,

Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher

Miklos Botha, PhD.
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Zimbra d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id

Your invoice. Paid. In attachment. Thank you!

From : Mag Ioan Valentin <zoobiomag2004@yahoo.com>  Jum, Jul 03, 2020 07:10 PM

Subject : Your invoice. Paid. In attachment. Thank you! P

To : Dewi Elfidasari <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id> #1 attachment
Reply To : Mag Ioan Valentin <zoobiomag2004@yahoo.com>

Your invoice. Paid. In attachment. Thank you!

Petrescu-Mag I. V., PhD, Hab. Associate Professor & Senior Researcher (CSI) USAMV Cluj
& Bioflux SRL & University of Oradea, Tel: 0040 744470794 ; e-mail
zoobiomag2004@yahoo.com Visit our journals: Aquaculture, Aquarium, Conservation &
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Zimbra d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id

Re: RECEIPT TRANSFER OF FEE PUBLICATION IN AACL BIOFLUX

From : Miklos Botha <miklosbotha@yahoo.com> Jum, Jul 10, 2020 09:20 PM
Subject : Re: RECEIPT TRANSFER OF FEE PUBLICATION IN P
AACL BIOFLUX #1 attachment

To : Dewi Elfidasari <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
Reply To : Miklos Botha <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>

Dear Dewi Elfidasari,

concerning your manuscript submitted to AACL Bioflux the editorial team have some requests prior final
processing (please see attachment). Please go through the entire paper .

Please note: Always operate corrections/additions (or deletions) in the manuscript we sent to you (already

edited version) highlighted with a bright color (for easy identification). We never work on manuscript you
send back, just identifying the corrections and operate them on our document (to avoid any undesirable
accidental operations like changed page set up, or anything else - otherwise the editor have to start all the

work from the beginning, and we cannot ask editors to re-check every manuscript word by word to identify
unmarked modifications).
Thank you for understanding!

Looking forward for your kind response in order to publish your work as soon as possible.

Kind regards,
Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher

Miklos Botha, PhD.
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On Friday, June 12, 2020, 08:35:06 AM GMT+3, Miklos Botha <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>
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Dear Dewi Elfidasari,

thank you!
Coming back soon with more info!

Kind regards,

Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher

Miklos Botha, PhD.
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On Friday, June 12, 2020, 06:12:54 AM GMT+3, Dewi Elfidasari <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
wrote:

Dear Mr. Miklos Botha, Ph.D

I Send the following proof of transfer publication fee of the manuscript with the title:
“"Heavy Metals Concentration in Water, Sediment, and Pterygoplychthys
pardalis from the Ciliwung River in Indonesia”

I pay 300 USD for instant processing of the manuscript

I hope my article can be published in this journal as soon as possible
Thank you so much for your attention

Sincerely
Dewi Elfidasari

From: "Miklos Botha" <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>
To: "Dewi Elfidasari" <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
Sent: Wednesday, June 10, 2020 7:28:45 PM
Subject: Re: AACL Bioflux

Dear Dr. Dewi Elfidasari,
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the priority processing implies the instant processing of the manuscript after we have the payment certainty.

Looking forward for your kind response!

Kind regards,
Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher
Miklos Botha, PhD.
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On Tuesday, June 9, 2020, 02:31:59 PM GMT+3, Dewi Elfidasari <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
wrote:

Dear Mr. Miklos Botha, Ph.D.
Editor AACL Bioflux & Senior Researcher

Thank you so much for this information

I'll choose the no 1 methods to tranfer the publication fee but | need more information
about:

1. If i choose to publish my manuscript with priority, how long my article will be publish in
AACL Bioflux Journal

2. The accounts name of this account number (Account

USD: RO68BTRL01302202L28614XX)

Thank you so much for your kindness
Sincerely

Dr. Dewi Elfidasari

From: "Miklos Botha" <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>
To: "Dewi Elfidasari" <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
Sent: Monday, June 8, 2020 3:42:13 AM
Subject: AACL Bioflux

Dear Dr. Dewi Elfidasari,
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We would like to inform you that after the preliminary evaluation your paper is
qualified for processing (reviewing).

Before proceeding to the review please consider that a processing publication
fee of 250 USD is required. The average duration of the publication process is
10 weeks, but it can be reduced in exchange of a priority tax of 50 USD
(http://www.bioflux.com.ro/journal/).

In case the manuscript is not published, the author or his/her institution is
reimbursed (exceptions are made in the cases of poor feedback from authors
or withdrawal/rejection due to multiple submissions).

I will be your editor and I will stay at your disposition for all the aspects
concerning your manuscript.

Concerning the payment procedure, you will find all the details bellow and | would like to kindly ask you to
send me the scanned receipt of the payment in order to start the publishing process. Upon reception of your
payment receipt we will send you the invoice.

1st payment option:

Beneficiary:

Bioflux SRL

City: Cluj-Napoca ,

Country: Romania, European Union;

SWIFT CODE of the bank: BTRLRO22

Account USD:
RO68BTRL01302202L28614XX

Bank:
BANCA TRANSILVANIA

Important! When bank transfer is used to pay a publication fee, please choose
the right option, which is "US”! (among the three options you have: Ben, Our,
Us).

The option “Us” means that all the transfer fees are at your charge. Please note that in case you do not
specify the “Us” option, the payment will not be valid.

2nd payment option:
via Paypal. If you can process such a payment we can start the online form.

If you prefer this option please let us know and we will send you the invoice via Paypal and afterwards you
can process the payment.

For this payment option you need a credit card (international, non-iranian card). Please take into account
that all bank taxes are in your concern.

Do not hesitate to contact me for any kind of questions related to the process.

Thank you for publishing with us!

Kind regards,

Editor AACL Bioflux
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Senior Researcher

Miklos Botha, PhD.
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Zimbra d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id

Re: RECEIPT TRANSFER OF FEE PUBLICATION IN AACL BIOFLUX

From : Dewi Elfidasari <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id> Sel, Jul 21, 2020 04:05 AM

Subject : Re: RECEIPT TRANSFER OF FEE PUBLICATION IN AACL
BIOFLUX

To : Miklos Botha <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>

Dear Miklos Botha, PhD.
Editor AACL Bioflux

Senior Researcher

Thank you so much for this information
It's to kind publish my paper in this journal

Best Regards
Dewi Elfidasari

From: "Miklos Botha" <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>

To: "Dewi Elfidasari" <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>

Sent: Tuesday, July 21, 2020 2:21:53 AM

Subject: Re: RECEIPT TRANSFER OF FEE PUBLICATION IN AACL BIOFLUX

Dear Dewi Elfidasari,
We would like to inform you that your paper submitted to AACL Bioflux has

been published:
http://www.bioflux.com.ro/docs/2020.1764-1778.pdf

Thank you for publishing with us!

Kind regards,

Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher

Miklos Botha, PhD.
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On Wednesday, July 15, 2020, 12:16:35 AM GMT+3, Dewi Elfidasari
<d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Miklos Botha, Ph.D
Editor AACL Bioflux

I've revised Figure 6
Thank you so much for reviewing process
I hope this article can be published as soon as possible

Best regard
Dewi Elfidasari

From: "Miklos Botha" <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>

To: "Dewi Elfidasari" <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>

Sent: Tuesday, July 14, 2020 10:29:23 PM

Subject: Re: RECEIPT TRANSFER OF FEE PUBLICATION IN AACL BIOFLUX

Dear Dewi Elfidasari,

there only one issue remained unsolved (at Figure 6). Please see attachment.

Looking forward for your kind response!

Kind regards,
Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher

Miklos Botha, PhD.
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On Saturday, July 11, 2020, 05:53:55 AM GMT+3, Dewi Elfidasari
<d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Miklos Botha, Ph.D.
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Editor AACL Bioflux

Hereby I send the revised manuscript.
Thank you so much for the editorial teamwork that has been reviewing my manuscript

Kind Regards

Dewi Elfidasari

From: "Miklos Botha" <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>

To: "Dewi Elfidasari" <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>

Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 9:20:58 PM

Subject: Re: RECEIPT TRANSFER OF FEE PUBLICATION IN AACL BIOFLUX

Dear Dewi Elfidasari,

concerning your manuscript submitted to AACL Bioflux the editorial team have some requests prior final
processing (please see attachment). Please go through the entire paper .

Please note: Always operate corrections/additions (or deletions) in the manuscript we sent to you (already

edited version) highlighted with a bright color (for easy identification). We never work on manuscript you
send back, just identifying the corrections and operate them on our document (to avoid any undesirable
accidental operations like changed page set up, or anything else - otherwise the editor have to start all the

work from the beginning, and we cannot ask editors to re-check every manuscript word by word to identify
unmarked modifications).
Thank you for understanding!

Looking forward for your kind response in order to publish your work as soon as possible.

Kind regards,
Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher
Miklos Botha, PhD.
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On Friday, June 12, 2020, 08:35:06 AM GMT+3, Miklos Botha <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>
wrote:

Dear Dewi Elfidasari,

thank you!
Coming back soon with more info!

Kind regards,

Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher

Miklos Botha, PhD.
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On Friday, June 12, 2020, 06:12:54 AM GMT+3, Dewi Elfidasari <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
wrote:

Dear Mr. Miklos Botha, Ph.D

I Send the following proof of transfer publication fee of the manuscript with the title:
“"Heavy Metals Concentration in Water, Sediment, and Pterygoplychthys
pardalis from the Ciliwung River in Indonesia”

I pay 300 USD for instant processing of the manuscript

I hope my article can be published in this journal as soon as possible
Thank you so much for your attention

Sincerely
Dewi Elfidasari

From: "Miklos Botha" <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>
To: "Dewi Elfidasari" <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
Sent: Wednesday, June 10, 2020 7:28:45 PM
Subject: Re: AACL Bioflux
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Dear Dr. Dewi Elfidasari,

the priority processing implies the instant processing of the manuscript after we have the payment certainty.

Looking forward for your kind response!

Kind regards,
Editor AACL Bioflux
Senior Researcher
Miklos Botha, PhD.
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On Tuesday, June 9, 2020, 02:31:59 PM GMT+3, Dewi Elfidasari <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
wrote:

Dear Mr. Miklos Botha, Ph.D.
Editor AACL Bioflux & Senior Researcher

Thank you so much for this information

I'll choose the no 1 methods to tranfer the publication fee but | need more information
about:

1. If i choose to publish my manuscript with priority, how long my article will be publish in
AACL Bioflux Journal

2. The accounts name of this account number (Account

USD: RO68BTRL01302202L28614XX)

Thank you so much for your kindness
Sincerely

Dr. Dewi Elfidasari

From: "Miklos Botha" <miklosbotha@yahoo.com>
To: "Dewi Elfidasari" <d_elfidasari@uai.ac.id>
Sent: Monday, June 8, 2020 3:42:13 AM
Subject: AACL Bioflux
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Dear Dr. Dewi Elfidasari,

We would like to inform you that after the preliminary evaluation your paper is
qualified for processing (reviewing).

Before proceeding to the review please consider that a processing publication
fee of 250 USD is required. The average duration of the publication process is
10 weeks, but it can be reduced in exchange of a priority tax of 50 USD
(http://www.bioflux.com.ro/journal/).

In case the manuscript is not published, the author or his/her institution is
reimbursed (exceptions are made in the cases of poor feedback from authors
or withdrawal/rejection due to multiple submissions).

I will be your editor and I will stay at your disposition for all the aspects
concerning your manuscript.

Concerning the payment procedure, you will find all the details bellow and | would like to kindly ask you to
send me the scanned receipt of the payment in order to start the publishing process. Upon reception of your
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